
Average Nation

Age 56 63

Length of Stay (Days) 21.75 19.46

Functional Change Per Day 0.87 0.82

Case Mix Index (CMI) 1.96 1.52

Minutes of Therapy Per Week 960 947

Discharge to the Community 73.81% 68.49%

Discharge to Acute Care 13.53% 16.93%

Falls 2.8% 3.36%

Brooks Rehabilitation o� ers a full system of care—from 
inpatient to outpatient to post-rehabilitation programs—to 
meet each patient’s needs at all stages of recovery. The 
depth and breadth of services o� ered at Brooks mean 
patients receive highly personalized care focused on their 
specifi c goals.

For more than 50 years, we’ve been helping patients with 
traumatic and non-traumatic brain injuries achieve their 
highest level of recovery possible. Our team includes 
certifi ed brain injury specialists working with the latest 
technology and evidence-based treatment options to 
ensure our patients receive best-in-class care.

One highly specialized option is our Disorders of 
Consciousness program. This short-term program 
was designed for patients who present in a reduced 
or minimally conscious state.  A patient is provided 
comprehensive evaluations, specifi c therapies, medications 
and stimulation that may promote recovery. 

Brooks also o� ers specialized programs developed to 
help with the unique needs of brain injury survivors, such 
as: driver rehabilitation, day treatment, Neuro Recovery 
Centers, Brooks Clubhouse, Brooks Aphasia Center, 
wellness and Brooks Adaptive Sports & Recreation.
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Program Overview

Traumatic:

187

Non-Traumatic:

231

Types of Brain Injuries

569 patients

353 males
216 females


